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11/6/2020 Invertis.org Mail - Fwd: Abstract Modification

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=6bd4251039&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1560865336674890706&simpl=msg-f%3A1560865… 1/2

Amritansh Mishra <amritansh.m@invertis.org>

Fwd: Abstract Modification 
1 message

Rubina Verma <rubina.v@invertis.org> Fri, Mar 3, 2017 at 9:36 PM
To: Amritansh Mishra <amritansh.m@invertis.org>, Amritansh Mishra <amritansh.project@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Anoop Kumar Bhartiya <geew2017@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 3 Mar 2017 at 1:59 PM 
Subject: Re: Abstract Modification 
To: Rubina Verma <rubina.v@invertis.org> 

Recieved.

Kindly fill the attached Registration Form and send it with remittance of registration fee as per information given in the
Seminar Brochure to avoid on-spot upheaval,  along with the travel plan before March 05, 2017 to enable us finalize
the Programme Schedule and arrange for your accommodation on payment basis much in advance. Please note that
Co-author(s) are also required to register on the similar way.

 

Looking forward to your active presence and participation,

On Thu, Mar 2, 2017 at 11:59 AM, Rubina Verma <rubina.v@invertis.org> wrote: 
 
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Rubina Verma <rubina.v@invertis.org> 
Date: Thu, Mar 2, 2017 at 11:59 AM 
Subject: Re: Abstract Modification 
To: rajnesh yadav <geew2017@gmail.com> 
 
 
Dear Sir,
This is bring to your kind notice that we three ( Mr. Amritansh , Ms Nasreen Javed, Dr. Rubina verma) are from
same university and have sent three Abstract through a common mail i.e.rubina.v @invertis.org. I have got
acceptance for three papers under my name only but we are three authors
Let me specify you:
 
Empowering Women at Work Place: Author : Mr. Amritansh Mishra
Gender Inequality at Work Place: Author : Ms Nasreen Javed
Women Empowerment : Concept and Approach,  Author : Dr. Rubina Verma
 
Kindly find the attached files and ignore the previous mail. Please sent us acceptance again so that we can
proceed for registration.
I regret for convenience and eagerly waiting for Positive reply.
 
On Thu, Mar 2, 2017 at 11:36 AM, rajnesh yadav <geew2017@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
 
The abstract sent is having the same title and content. Would request you to modify the
title and content and resend the modified abstract latest by today evening. 
 
 

Yours sincerely

Dr. Anoop Kumar Bhartiya

mailto:geew2017@gmail.com
mailto:rubina.v@invertis.org
mailto:rubina.v@invertis.org
mailto:rubina.v@invertis.org
mailto:geew2017@gmail.com
http://invertis.org/
mailto:geew2017@gmail.com
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https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=6bd4251039&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1562133553918424859&simpl=msg-f%3A1562133… 3/7

<kvarma@lko.amity.edu>, "Pinki Negi Bora" <yashnegi0110@gmail.com>, "Roshani Rai" <rai_rosh@yahoo.co.in>,
"chhaya soni" <me.chhaya26@gmail.com>, "rashmi jain" <rashmii.jain23@gmail.com>, "Dr. Vartika Srivastava"
<vsrivastava@lko.amity.edu>, "Preeti Mishra" <preetibalamishra@gmail.com>, "Jyoti Dev Tripathi"
<jtmshr23@gmail.com>, "Divya Singh" <parisingh856@gmail.com>, "vinod vaishya" <vinodvaishya00@gmail.com>,
"Birendri Kumari" <birendri.cug@gmail.com>, "Neera Cecil" <cecil.neera@gmail.com>, "Shyam Singh"
<shyamsinghbhu@gmail.com>, "Vidushi Srivastava" <vidushis.1993@gmail.com>, "Abdul Ahad"
<ahad9760@gmail.com>, "vaishalee bhrigu" <vaishalee.bhrigu@gmail.com>, "Malavika Ahlawat"
<malavika.ahlawat@gmail.com>, "RUCHI AGARWAL" <ragarwal111187@gmail.com>, "Ekta Awasthi"
<ekta.awasthi06@gmail.com>, "Ayesha Fatima" <aliyahassan35@gmail.com>, "naina jaiswal"
<cutenaina60@gmail.com>, "andrey shastri" <shastriandrey59@gmail.com>, "Goal Tara" <goaltara@yahoo.com>,
"legalyp" <legalyp@gmail.com>, "SARTHAK SINGH" <sarthak8390@gmail.com>, "Monika Gautam"
<mgautam@lko.amity.edu>, "Anamika Gupta" <anamikagupta033@gmail.com>, "Vibha Dwivedi"
<vibhakrishnaau@gmail.com>, "Surekha Yadav" <kyadav428@gmail.com>, "Prof. Dr. Mala Tandon (Dy. Director-
AIE)" <mtondon@lko.amity.edu>, "Rubina Verma" <rubina.v@invertis.org>, "rahul kashyap"
<rhlkashyap11@gmail.com>, "SANJEEV UPADHYAY" <upadhyaysanjeev351@gmail.com>,
<abassum8926@gmail.com>, "Charu Dwivedi" <charudwivedi8@gmail.com>, "abdul ahad"
<abdula2423@gmail.com>, "Deep Narayan Pandey" <deepandey13@gmail.com>, "Anuj Kumar Sharma"
<aksharma2@lko.amity.edu>, "Rajesh Kushwaha" <manurajchandra@gmail.com>, "Asiya Nasreen"
<anasreen@jmi.ac.in>, "laxmi prasad" <anuragilaxmi1112@gmail.com>, "Rajesh Kushwaha"
<kushwaharajabhilasha@gmail.com>, <shams@lawlaboratory.com>, "Ambrish Khare" <aryan2013k@gmail.com>,
"sadiya khan" <khansadiya1989@gmail.com>, "Pramesh Chandra" <prameshchandrarsl@gmail.com>, "bush"
<bushran0626@gmail.com>, "Neeti kushwaha" <neeti.kushwaha@rediffmail.com>, "Dr. Kirti Vikram Singh"
<kvsingh@ignou.ac.in>, "nasreen.j" <nasreen.j@invertis.org>, "Sunita Bharti" <sunita.bharti502@gmail.com>,
"saswati chakraborti" <saswati146@rediffmail.com>, "kalpana Singh" <kalvisingh220@gmail.com>, "Avichal Singh
Bishen" <bishenavichal@gmail.com>, "Garima Singh" <singh.pride7@gmail.com>, "Aparna Dixit"
<talk.aparna@gmail.com>, "ashu yadav" <ashuyadav2002@gmail.com>, "Samra Anwer"
<samrashadow@gmail.com>, "kavita52526" <kavita52526@gmail.com>, "Anas khan" <anasmkhansw@gmail.com>,
"Omendra Kr. Yadav" <omendrakryadav@gmail.com>, <kartikeyatiwari2131@gmail.com>, "Shubham Singh"
<mailshubh30@gmail.com>, <shyamalee.misra@gmail.com>, "Shikha Singh" <shikha.singh0509@gmail.com>,
<sweetyvermasw@gmail.com>, "RANVIR SINGH" <rvsiss13@gmail.com>, "Aditi Ghildyal"
<theaditighildyal@gmail.com>, "sunita yadav" <happysonu1774@gmail.com> 
Cc: "Srivastava Shashikant" <getkantshashi@gmail.com>, "Anoop Bhartiya" <bhartiya.ak@gmail.com> 

Dear Sir/Madam

 

Thank you so much for your presence and participation in the National Seminar on Gender
Equity and Empowerment of Women (17-18 March, 2017), organised by the Centre for
Advanced Studies in Social Work, University of Lucknow.

 

Since the Seminar dates are quite close, I would like to request you to please:

 

1. Register your participation with Fee.
2. Send your travel plan for making your accommodation arrangements as per availability.

 

Please ignore, if already done.

 

A tentative Schedule for Parallel Sessions is being enclosed for your perusal.
[Quoted text hidden]

Parallel Session.docx 
118K

Rubina Verma <rubina.v@invertis.org> Fri, Mar 17, 2017 at 9:34 PM
To: Amritansh Mishra <amritansh.m@invertis.org>

mailto:kvarma@lko.amity.edu
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mailto:abassum8926@gmail.com
mailto:charudwivedi8@gmail.com
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mailto:shams@lawlaboratory.com
mailto:aryan2013k@gmail.com
mailto:khansadiya1989@gmail.com
mailto:prameshchandrarsl@gmail.com
mailto:bushran0626@gmail.com
mailto:neeti.kushwaha@rediffmail.com
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mailto:singh.pride7@gmail.com
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Authorized Signatory 

Conference Secretary 
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Ist NATIONAL CONFERENCE 

DIGITAL INDIA-DIGITAL 
EMPOWERMENT TO CITIZENS 

14,15 January 2017 (Saturday & Sunday) 
Organized By- 

Ram Lubhai Sahani Govt. Girls P.G. College, Pilibhit 
No. 592 REGISTRATION FEE RECEIPT Date..5 
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as registration Fee of the National Conference. 
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03/11/2020 Gmail - RE: Research Paper for ICRTESM-2017 ietep756

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/4?ui=2&ik=11d42b6069&view=lg&permmsgid=msg-f:1573506619603730190 1/2

Pragati Jain <pragatimpi6@gmail.com>

RE: Research Paper for ICRTESM-2017 ietep756 

submission@conferenceinfo.org <submission@conferenceinfo.org> Fri, Jul 21, 2017 at 10:23 AM
To: Pragati Jain <pragatimpi6@gmail.com>

5th International Conference on Research Trends in Engineering, Applied Science and
Management (ICRTESM-2017)

@The Institution of Electronics and Telecommunication Engineers (IETE,Pune)

 (23  July 2017 Sunday)

Comparitive Study of Various Network Simulators
 
Pragati Jain        Akash Sanghi

Congratulations!

We are pleased to inform you that after peer reviewed process of paper the above-mentioned paper has been accepted for
ICRTESM-17. Your paper will be published in special issues of associated peer reviewed, Refereed, and indexed UGC
Approved international Journals.

·        Two different types kind of Hard copy of certificates will be provided to all authors of one paper (Conference
Presentation at IETE, Journal Publication).
·        Conference Proceeding will be published online on conferenceinfo.org with ISBN 
·         All the papers will be indexed in Google Scholar.
·        Conference proceeding will be indexed in Diif
·        Paper will be published in any one of the following UGC approved  Journals

1. International Journal of Engineering Technology Management and Applied Science(IJETMAS, ISSN-2349-
4476, Impact Factor 2.24) (UGC report)
2.International Journal of Engineering Technology Science and Research IJETSR, ISSN-2394-3386, Impact
Factor 2.120)(UGC Report)
3. International Journal of Innovations and Advancement in Computer Science (IJIACS, ISSN- 2347-8616,  
Impact Factor- 2.65)  (UGC Report)
4. International Journal of Computer and Mathematical Science (IJCMS, ISSN-2347-8527, Impact Factor- 2.58)
(UGC Report)
5. International Journal of Electrical & Electronic and Computational Science (IJEECS, ISSN-2348-117X,Impact
Factor 2.52)  (UGC Report)

For ugc Serial Number of Journal you may see
http://conferenceinfo.org/conferenedetail.php?id=58#view3

Fee Details
Category Indian Authors (INR) Per Paper Foreign Authors USD Per Paper

Corporate Executive 3000 200
Academicians+Research Scholar 2500 150

 only Research Scholar/ Students 2000 100

» Maximum three authors in one research paper.
» If More than three authors, each extra author will be added with additional 500 INR/USD30. 
» Page Limit 12 Pages. Extra Page will be added by 100INR/USD10 per page.
 
Account Detail
 Account detail is as follows:
Name:             Academic Science

http://conferenceinfo.org/
http://www.ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDM1MDU=
http://ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=43505
http://ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDQ0MzE=
http://www.ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDc0NjQ=
http://www.ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDM0NjQ=
http://www.ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDgyMDM
http://conferenceinfo.org/conferenedetail.php?id=58#view3
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A/c No:           913020057348815                                                                        
BANK:           AXIS BANK
IFSC CODE:  UTIB0000095
Account Type: Current
Amount:          As per above table
Kindly complete all formalities to confirm registration. You are requested to mail  filled and signed registration form
only.Registration form is attached.

Mode of Payment Indian Authors Fee can be Paid through
1. NEFT/RTGS/IMPS/Net Banking.
2. You can also deposit cash in any branch of Axis Banks.
3. http://conferenceinfo.org/payment/
Above is 24*7 payment gateway ( Payu money) link for fee payment through debit card or credit card.There is no extra
fee for Using Payment Gateway.

Fee details are to be provided in registration form. Kindly send scan copy/Screen shot of fee details also

Chief Editor
Conference info,
IETE Pune conference Team
Mob:09873275385
Whats App:09873309345

-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: RE: Research Paper for ICRTESM-2017 ietep756 
From: <submission@conferenceinfo.org> 
Date: Thu, July 20, 2017 3:59 pm 
To: "Pragati Jain" <pragatimpi6@gmail.com> 

Dear author
Kindly note your paper id is ietep756.
It is under review
thanking you

Chief Editor
Conference info,
IETE Pune conference Team
Mob:09873275385
Whats App:09873309345

-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: Research Paper for ICRTESM-2017 
From: Pragati Jain <pragatimpi6@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, July 20, 2017 3:17 pm 
To: submission@conferenceinfo.org 

Dear Sir/ Madam,
Pfa for the research paper.
Kindly reply for further action.

Thanks and Regards,
Pragati Jain
pragatimpi6@gmail.com
9319780719

http://conferenceinfo.org/payment
mailto:submission@conferenceinfo.org
mailto:pragatimpi6@gmail.com
mailto:pragatimpi6@gmail.com
mailto:submission@conferenceinfo.org
mailto:pragatimpi6@gmail.com
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https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ik=d22f43a748&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1547976918591845911&simpl=msg-f%3A15479769… 1/2

Anil Pandey <anipandey@gmail.com>

Fwd: SMART 2016 notification for Acceptance | paper 102 
1 message

SAKSHI TRIPATHI <sakshi.tripathi1593@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 12, 2016 at 3:20 PM
To: anil.p@invertis.org

---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: "SMART 2016" <smart2016@easychair.org> 
Date: Oct 12, 2016 12:37 PM 
Subject: SMART 2016 notification for Acceptance | paper 102 
To: "Sakshi Tripathi" <sakshi.tripathi1593@gmail.com> 
Cc:  

Dear Sakshi Tripathi, 

I am glad to advise that your paper entitled DNA SEQUENCING BY USING STRING MATCHING TECHNIQUES has
been accepted for 
publication in SMART-2016. 
You are requested to register before 01st  Nov, 2016 to get the benefits of EARY 
BIRD Registration, and send the filled Registration Form, Copyright Form of IEEE, 
CRC Checklist, Certificate of Originality and Copyright Transfer Form at 
smartconf@tmu.ac.in
You are requested to upload the camera ready paper at the easy chair account latest 
by 20th -Oct-2016. 
Registration Form, Copyright Form, CRC Checklist, Copyright Transfer Form can be 
downloaded from the conference website smartconference.co.in 
For any other enquiry feel free to call Mr. Danish Ather at +919760034342 or mail us 
at smartconf@tmu.ac.in 
The letter is a testimony of the fact that the concepts proposed by the authors in 
the paper will be deemed as an invention by the authors in effect from the mentioned 
date. The testimony will be valid until any individual/ organization furnishes 
tangible proofs of copyright infringements. Any reports of copyright allegations 
will be conveyed to the authors for reciprocal actions. 

Thanks 
Prof. Rakesh Kumar Dwivedi 
Conference General Chair 
5th International Conference (SMART-5) 
25-27  November 2016 
College of Computing Sciences and Information Technology, 
Teerthanker Mahaveer University, Moradabad (U.P.), India -244001 
Contact: +91 9897672215 

----------------------- REVIEW 1 --------------------- 
PAPER: 102 
TITLE: DNA SEQUENCING BY USING STRING MATCHING TECHNIQUES 
AUTHORS: Sakshi Tripathi and Anil Pandey 

----------- OVERALL EVALUATION ----------- 
According to the author it is not mentioned clearly whether LCS (Longest Common Substring), Longest Common
Subsequence or Robin Karp algorithm is better. Although, Performance and Accuracy of both the algorithm is not
calculated. Also the working implementation of Longest Common Subsequence is not well documented. To prove the
above the algorithm more explanation is required. After doing above modifications paper may be accepted. 

----------------------- REVIEW 2 --------------------- 
PAPER: 102 
TITLE: DNA SEQUENCING BY USING STRING MATCHING TECHNIQUES 
AUTHORS: Sakshi Tripathi and Anil Pandey 

mailto:smart2016@easychair.org
mailto:sakshi.tripathi1593@gmail.com
mailto:smartconf@tmu.ac.in
http://smartconference.co.in/
mailto:smartconf@tmu.ac.in
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----------- OVERALL EVALUATION ----------- 
Research Paper introduces novel approach. 

----------------------- REVIEW 3 --------------------- 
PAPER: 102 
TITLE: DNA SEQUENCING BY USING STRING MATCHING TECHNIQUES 
AUTHORS: Sakshi Tripathi and Anil Pandey 

----------- OVERALL EVALUATION ----------- 
Suggested Points:- 
Change the title of the paper. 
1.       Perform Spell and grammar check. 
2.      No word breaks at the end of lines. 
3.      References appear consecutively in the paper. 
4.      Compare with other similar approach and give some analytical improvement in your approach. 

Approved with modification<This review contains an attachment, see the file 
review_3.pdf attached to this letter.> 

review_3.pdf 
170K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1?ui=2&ik=d22f43a748&view=att&th=157b84ce512bb617&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=25df74333699d12d_0.1&safe=1&zw
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Chandan Kumar <chandan.k@invertis.org>

Acceptance ietep750 
2 messages

submission@conferenceinfo.org <submission@conferenceinfo.org> Fri, Jul 21, 2017 at 9:46 AM
To: Chandan Kumar <chandan.k@invertis.org>

5th International Conference on Research Trends in Engineering, Applied Science and
Management (ICRTESM-2017)

@The Institution of Electronics and Telecommunication Engineers (IETE,Pune)

 (23  July 2017 Sunday)

Connectivity based handoff scheme for WiMAX
 

Chandan Kumar                                 Ravi Shankar Shukla                            Gaurav Agarwal
 
 

 
Congratulations!

We are pleased to inform you that after peer reviewed process of paper the above-mentioned paper has been accepted for
ICRTESM-17. Your paper will be published in special issues of associated peer reviewed, Refereed, and indexed UGC
Approved international Journals.

·        Two different types kind of Hard copy of certificates will be provided to all authors of one paper (Conference
Presentation at IETE, Journal Publication).
·        Conference Proceeding will be published online on conferenceinfo.org with ISBN 
·         All the papers will be indexed in Google Scholar.
·        Conference proceeding will be indexed in Diif
·        Paper will be published in any one of the following UGC approved  Journals

1. International Journal of Engineering Technology Management and Applied Science(IJETMAS, ISSN-2349-
4476, Impact Factor 2.24) (UGC report)
2.International Journal of Engineering Technology Science and Research IJETSR, ISSN-2394-3386, Impact
Factor 2.120)(UGC Report)
3. International Journal of Innovations and Advancement in Computer Science (IJIACS, ISSN- 2347-8616,  
Impact Factor- 2.65)  (UGC Report)
4. International Journal of Computer and Mathematical Science (IJCMS, ISSN-2347-8527, Impact Factor- 2.58)
(UGC Report)
5. International Journal of Electrical & Electronic and Computational Science (IJEECS, ISSN-2348-117X,Impact
Factor 2.52)  (UGC Report)

For ugc Serial Number of Journal you may see
http://conferenceinfo.org/conferenedetail.php?id=58#view3

Fee Details
Category Indian Authors (INR) Per Paper Foreign Authors USD Per Paper

Corporate Executive 3000 200
Academicians+Research Scholar 2500 150

http://conferenceinfo.org/
http://www.ugc.ac.in/journallist/ugc_admin_journal_report.aspx?eid=NDM1MDU=
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 only Research Scholar/ Students 2000 100

» Maximum three authors in one research paper.
» If More than three authors, each extra author will be added with additional 500 INR/USD30. 
» Page Limit 12 Pages. Extra Page will be added by 100INR/USD10 per page.
 
Account Detail
 Account detail is as follows:
Name:             Academic Science
A/c No:           913020057348815                                                                        
BANK:           AXIS BANK
IFSC CODE:  UTIB0000095
Account Type: Current
Amount:          As per above table
Kindly complete all formalities to confirm registration. You are requested to mail  filled and signed registration form
only.Registration form is attached.

Mode of Payment Indian Authors Fee can be Paid through
1. NEFT/RTGS/IMPS/Net Banking.
2. You can also deposit cash in any branch of Axis Banks.
3. http://conferenceinfo.org/payment/
Above is 24*7 payment gateway ( Payu money) link for fee payment through debit card or credit card.There is no extra
fee for Using Payment Gateway.

Fee details are to be provided in registration form. Kindly send scan copy/Screen shot of fee details also

Chief Editor
Conference info,
IETE Pune conference Team
Mob:09873275385
Whats App:09873309345

-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: RE: Research Paper submission ietep750 
From: <submission@conferenceinfo.org> 
Date: Thu, July 20, 2017 3:42 pm 
To: "Chandan Kumar" <chandan.k@invertis.org> 

Dear author
Kindly note your paper id is ietep750.
It is under review
thanking you

Chief Editor
Conference info,
IETE Pune conference Team
Mob:09873275385
Whats App:09873309345

-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: Research Paper submission 
From: Chandan Kumar <chandan.k@invertis.org> 
Date: Thu, July 20, 2017 2:01 pm 
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To: submission@conferenceinfo.org 

Dear Sir/Mam,

Please find the attachment for the research paper.  

Thanking you

Chandan Kumar 
Assistant Professor 
Invertis University
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Chandan Kumar <chandan.k@invertis.org> Fri, Jul 21, 2017 at 2:01 PM
To: Gaurav Agarwal <gaurav.a1@invertis.org>

[Quoted text hidden]
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