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Hanisha Chawla <hanisha.c@invertis.org> |

Fwd: Wipro Campus Update_!LOl
1 message

Ashish Maheshwari <ashish.m1@invertis.org>
To: Hanisha Chawla <hanisha.c@invertis.org>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: kalpana Gangwar <kalpana.g@invertis.org>
Date: Mon, Dec 27, 2021 at 11:14 AM

Subject: Fwd: Wipro Campus Update_LOI

To: Ashish Maheshwari <ashish.m1@inveris.org>

----—--— Forwarded message -------—-

From: pogja singh <poojas260t@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Dec 24, 2021 at 2:10 PM

Subject: Fwd: Wipro Campus Update_LOI

Mon, Dec 27, 2021 at 12:04 PM

To: kalpana.g@invertis.org <kalpana.g@invertis.org>, Jitendra Kumar Chaudhary <jitendra.c@invertis.org>

Papja Singh
Bca 5th semester Sec A
ID- Bc2019129

-—-—-— Forwarded message ---------

From: Campus HR Team <wipro+email+2wadu-497c3a3911@talent.icims.com>

Date: Sat, 18 Dec 2021, 10:50 am
Subject: Wipro Campus Update_L Ol
To: <onojas26C1@gmail.corn>

December 18, 2021

Dear Pooja Singh ,
Resume Number - 23379418

Based on our discussion with you, we would like to inform you of our intent to offer you the role of Scholar

Director Corporate Relations

mvenrtis Hnversity

o

Trainee- Work Integrated Learning Program which will be in Career Band WASE/WIMS

of the organization.

The stack for this role is detailed below. Do reach out to us should you have any clarifications.

Regisk
Inverdis Undlvers

Period Scholarship ESI ﬁiﬂ?ﬁ}%ﬂ@cm"amh'p‘ (INR Per
First year 15000 488 15,488/- (*}

Sacond year 17000 553 17,553/- (%)

Third year 19000 518 19,618/~ (*)

Fourth year | 23000 0 23,000/~ (1)

(*)You shall be responsible for payment of all statutory contributions, taxes, dues and levies as

required under the relevant laws including contributions under Employees’ State Insurance
Corporation Act (at 0.75% of your Scholarship) as and when applicable to you. Such

-

contributions, taxes, dues and levies where required, shall be deducted from your Scholarship
and benefits according to applicable laws and regulations.
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Invertis.org Mail - Fwd: Wipro Campus Update_LC}
This message was sent to poojas2601@gmait.com. If you don't want to receive these emails from this company in the
future, please go to:

hitps fiwipro.icims.com/icims2/7r=13C 1233794 18&contactid=16054233

® Wipro Limited, Doddakannelli, Sarjapur Roat Bengalury 560 035 IND

With regards,

Kalpana Gangwar

Assistant Professor

Dept. of Computer Applications
Invertis Liniversity

U

Divacter Eorporate Rglations
yartia University
Pareilly
Regfstrar

tnvertis University
Jargilly  ew-
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